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A timeless story rediscovered by each new generation,
The Diary of a Young Girl stands without peer. For both
young readers and adults it continues to capture the
remarkable spirit of Anne Frank, who for a time survived
the worst horror the modern world has seen—and who
remained triumphantly and heartbreakingly human
throughout her ordeal. Adapted by Ari Folman, illustrated
by David Polonsky, and authorized by the Anne Frank
Foundation in Basel, this is the first graphic edition of
The Diary and includes extensive quotation directly from
the definitive edition. It remains faithful to the original,
while the stunning illustrations interpret and add layers of
visual meaning and immediacy to this classic work of
Holocaust literature.
“A definitive, deeply moving inquiry into the life of the
young, imperiled artist, and a masterful exegesis of Diary
of a Young Girl…Extraordinary testimony to the power of
literature and compassion” –Booklist (starred review) In
Anne Frank: The Book, the Life, the Afterlife, Francine
Prose, author of Reading Like a Writer, deftly parses the
artistry, ambition, and enduring influence of Anne
Frank’s beloved classic, The Diary of a Young Girl.
Approved by both the Anne Frank House Foundation in
Amsterdam and the Anne Frank-Fonds in Basel, run by
the Frank family, this work of literary criticism unravels
the complex, fascinating story of the diary and effectively
makes the case for it being a work of art from a
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precociously gifted writer.
Based on the letters between the author and Otto Frank,
the father of Anne Frank, the story of a twenty-year
correspondence reveals the man who became a
surrogate father to numerous children all over the world.
The Diary of Anne Frank by Frances Goodrich and Albert
Hackett "This Drama Play is a wonderful addition to
anyone who has a passion for Anne Frank related
reading. A dramatization for the stage and ready for
anyone, including schools, to use."
A young girl's journal records her family's struggles
during two years of hiding from the Nazis in war-torn
Holland.
Dramatisation of the events in the diary of Anne Frank.
The play tells the story of Anne Frank who went into
hiding for two years with her family and friends before
being discovered by the Nazis and sent to the
concentration camp. The book includes assignments
about the characters and themes of the play.
The New York Times bestselling account of one of
history's most brutal -- and forgotten -- massacres, when
the Japanese army destroyed China's capital city on the
eve of World War II In December 1937, one of the most
horrific atrocities in the long annals of wartime barbarity
occurred. The Japanese army swept into the ancient city
of Nanking (what was then the capital of China), and
within weeks, more than 300,000 Chinese civilians and
soldiers were systematically raped, tortured, and
murdered. In this seminal work, Iris Chang, whose own
grandparents barely escaped the massacre, tells this
history from three perspectives: that of the Japanese
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soldiers, that of the Chinese, and that of a group of
Westerners who refused to abandon the city and created
a safety zone, which saved almost 300,000 Chinese.
Drawing on extensive interviews with survivors and
documents brought to light for the first time, Iris Chang's
classic book is the definitive history of this horrifying
episode. "Chang vividly, methodically, records what
happened, piecing together the abundant eyewitness
reports into an undeniable tapestry of horror." - Adam
Hochschild, Salon !--[if !supportAnnotations]-- !--[if
!supportAnnotations]-- !--[endif]--
Discusses such topics as the diary as literature, the
history of the Frank family, the plight of Holland's Jews,
rescuers of Holocaust children, and Anne's childhood
THE STORY: In this transcendently powerful new
adaptation by Wendy Kesselman, Anne Frank emerges
from history a living, lyrical, intensely gifted young girl,
who confronts her rapidly changing life and the
increasing horror of her time with astonis
“Gillham is a powerful storyteller, and Annelies is
marbled with spare eloquence that captures the
absurdity of life after the camps. . . . A novel that reminds
the world to remember Anne Frank is most welcome.”
—USA Today “A haunting what-if.” —Georgia Hunter,
New York Times bestselling author of We Were the
Lucky Ones “Not only a poignant reminder of all that
was lost during the war, but a vivid, searching
exploration of what it meant to exist in the aftermath.”
—Jessica Shattuck, New York Times bestselling author of
The Women in the Castle From the author of City of
Women, a powerful new novel that asks the question:
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What if Anne Frank survived the Holocaust? Anne Frank
is a cultural icon whose diary painted a vivid picture of
the Holocaust and made her an image of humanity in
one of history’s darkest moments. But she was also a
person—a precocious young girl with a rich inner life and
tremendous skill as a writer. In this masterful new novel,
David R. Gillham explores with breathtaking empathy the
woman—and the writer—she might have become.
Research on crime victims' issues is a relatively new
phenomenon in the criminal justice field. With the birth of
victimology in the late 1940s and early 1950s, research
focused on victim-offender relationships and victim
culpability. It has only been in the last few decades that
researchers have both studied the effects of crime upon
the victim and analyzed the services provided to the
crime victim. In Current Issues in Victimology Research,
Moriarty and Jerin provide an understanding of the
criminal act's impact upon individuals and society
through recent research. The book provides the criminal
justice field with a foundation for grasping the
complexities of crime victimization. Current Issues in
Victimology Research serves well as a textbook for a
victimology course or as a companion to any traditional
text book. This new edition features the works of noted
scholars and practitioners in the field who summarize the
existing literature on victimology and its sub-areas. Many
of the chapters represent topical areas not covered in
other volumes, and the original research contained in the
chapters has not been published elsewhere.
In her amazing diary, Anne Frank revealed the
challenges and dreams common for any young girl. But
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Hitler brought her childhood to an end and forced her
and her family into hiding. Who Was Anne Frank? looks
closely at Anne’s life before the secret annex, what life
was like in hiding, and the legacy of her diary. Black-and-
white illustrations including maps and diagrams provide
historical and visual reference in an easy-to-read
biography written in a way that is appropriate and
accessible for younger readers.
The compelling diary of a young girl on the brink of
maturity as her life draws to toward its tragic end -- one
of the most moving and vivid documents of the Jewish
experience.
For the millions moved by Anne Frank: The Diary of a
Young Girl, here at last is Miep Geis's own astonishing
story. For more than two years, Miep Gies and her
husband helped hide the Franks from the Nazis. Like
thousands of unsung heroes of the Holocaust, they
risked their lives each day to bring food, news, and
emotional support to the victims. She found the diary and
brought the world a message of love and hope. It seems
as if we are never far from Miep's thoughts....Yours,
Anne From her own remarkable childhood as a World
War I refugee to the moment she places a small, red-
orange, checkered diary -- Anne's legacy -- in Otto
Frank's hands, Miep Gies remembers her days with
simple honesty and shattering clarity. Each page rings
with courage and heartbreaking beauty.
More than one hundred photographs, many never before
published, make up a poignant memoir of Anne Frank's
struggle to survive during a time that must never be
forgotten. Reprint.
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“Unique among survival books . . . stunning . . .
enthralling. Deep Survival makes compelling, and
chilling, reading.”—Denver Post Over a decade since its
original publication, Laurence Gonzales’s bestselling
Deep Survival has helped save lives from the deepest
wildernesses, just as it has improved readers’ everyday
lives. Its mix of adventure narrative, survival science, and
practical advice has inspired everyone from business
leaders to military officers, educators, and psychiatric
professionals on how to take control of stress, learn to
assess risk, and make better decisions under pressure.
Now with a new introduction on how this book can help
readers overcome any of life’s obstacles, Gonzales’s
gripping narrative is set to motivate and enlighten a new
generation of readers.
A comprehensive coronary care textbook for medical,
nursing and paramedic staff The Coronary Care Manual,
2nd Edition is a practical medical manual designed to
assist with management of the acute coronary patient.
This respected medical resource is written by a group of
coronary experts, both Australian and international. Its
aim is to strike a balance between a large and rapidly-
changing evidence base and practical application in the
Coronary Care Unit, Intensive Care Unit, Emergency
Department and the ambulance. The second edition of
this important health textbook covers an extensive range
of coronary care medicine, providing a handy companion
for a night ‘on call’. Chapter topics in the Coronary Care
Manual, 2nd Edition include pathophysiology, drug and
non-drug therapies and postcoronary management, with
chapters organised into subsections. Completely
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redesigned with fresh, new artwork, this new edition of
the Coronary Care Manual is organised to suit
academics and medical practitioners alike. • covers a
broad range of coronary care medicine • provides
specific advice on the management of common clinical
problems • eliminates the need to refer to a larger
reference book • features a consistent style and focus,
with standardised artwork for figures • is now also
available as an eBook! A code inside the Coronary Care
Manual enables a full text download, allowing you to
browse and search electronically, make notes and
bookmarks in the electronic files and highlight material
This Newbery Honor-winning book shows us that in the
steady courage of a young girl lies a profound strength
that can transcend the horrors of war. This is the true
story of a girl's extraordinary survival during the German
occupation of Holland of World War II. Annie was only
ten years old, but because she was Jewish, she was
forced to leave her family, her home, and everything she
knew. Annie was taken in, far from home, by complete
strangers who risked everything to help her. They
showed Annie where she had to stay - the cramped
upstairs room of their farmhouse. She would remain
there while Nazis, who were ever vigilant, patrolled the
streets outside. If Annie made even a sound from
upstairs, or if a nosy neighbor caught sight of her in the
window, it would surely mean a death sentence for her
and the family that took her in. Elie Wiesel writes, “This
admirable account is as important in every aspect as the
one bequeathed to us by Anne Frank." A Newbery Medal
Honor Book, ALA Notable Book, and winner of the
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Jewish Book Council Children’s Book Award. Be sure to
read the moving sequel "The Journey Back" by Johanna
Reiss.
No Marketing Blurb
A collection of the author's lesser-known writings
includes stories, personal reminiscences, previously
deleted excerpts from her diary, and an unfinished novel
composed while she was hidden from the Nazis.
India lives in a large, luxurious house with a mum she
can't stand and a dad she adores, though he hasn't had
much time for her recently. She seeks solace in her
journal, which she keeps in sincere imitation of her
heroine, Anne Frank. Treasure lives on t
Getting the right cut for the right fabric is the key to
gooddesign. One of the most challenging aspects of a
fashiondesigner’s training is learning how to crate
patterns thatutilize the characteristics of fabrics. With an
ever expandingrange available, an understanding of the
relationship betweenfabric, form and pattern shape is
now the most important skill adesigner has to acquire.
Winifred Aldrich, a leading pattern cutting authority,
exploreshow a garment’s shape is created and
discusses the factorsthat need to be considered when
creating patterns and offers you apractical method for
solving problems. No other pattern cuttingbook considers
the effects of individual fabrics and its approachis based
on the appraisal of the fabric and body shape. Fabrics
and Patterns Cutting is the revised andsimplified edition
of Fabric, Form and Flat PatternCutting. It is fully
illustrated and makes use of numerouspractical
examples. It also takes into account important
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newdevelopments in fabric – new fabrics, new methods
of fabricconstruction and new fabric finishes. Free block
patterns are available online for readers to printout for
use in their classes.
Thirteen year old Anne Frank, with her parents and sister
and four other people, went into hiding in the sealed-off
building in 1942, when the Nazi invaders intensified their
persecution of Jews. For two years they remained safe.
In August 1944 they were betrayed. Anne's diary was
found, and it reveals her life and her spirit.
The Diary of a Young Girl, also known as The Diary of
Anne Frank, is a book of the writings from the Dutch
language diary kept by Anne Frank while In 1942, with
zis occupying Holland, a thirteen-year-old Jewish girl and
her family fled their home in Amsterdam and went into
hiding.The family was apprehended in 1944, and Anne
Frank died of typhus in the Bergen-Belsen concentration
camp in 1945. In her diary Anne Frank recorded vivid
impressions of her experiences during this period. By
turns thoughtful, moving, and amusing, her account
offers a fasciting commentary on human courage and
frailty and a compelling self-portrait of a sensitive and
spirited young woman whose promise was tragically cut
short. The diary was retrieved by Miep Gies, who gave it
to Anne's father, Otto Frank, the family's only known
survivor, just after the war was over. The diary has since
been published in more than 60 languages.
An account of an Israeli soldier's experiences in Beirut
during the massacres at Sabra and Shatila follows his
recovered memories of his participation in the
September 1982 atrocities after he had forgotten them
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for more than twenty years.
In 1940, after Germany invaded the Netherlands, Anne
and her family couldn't leave the country, so they
decided to hide in a warehouse in an attempt to escape
the persecution of Jews by the Nazis. For over two
years, Anne wrote in her diary with an awareness that
was extremely mature for her age. She detailed her
experiences and insights while she and her family were
in hiding, living in a constant fear of being arrested. The
Diary of Anne Frank' is a record of her understanding of
the war and showcases her incredible storytelling
abilities in such horrific circumstances. In 1944, the
Franks were found and sent to concentration camps.
Anne died before she turned 16, and her father, Otto
Frank, was the only family member to survive the
Holocaust. After the War, Otto returned to Amsterdam,
where he found his daughter's diary and then published i
as The Diary of a Young Girl. The Diary of Anne Frank is
among the most enduring documents of the twentieth
century. Since its publication in 1947, it has been read by
tens of millions of peopleall over the world. It remains a
beloved and deeply admired testament to the
indestructible nature of the human spirit.
The story of Anne Frank and her diary is one of the
world's most important and well-known, but less is
known about the woman who sheltered Anne and her
family for years and, ultimately, rescued Anne's diary
from Nazi clutches. Miep Gies was a woman who rose to
bravery when humanity needed it and risked everything
for her neighbors. It is because of Miep we know Anne
Frank--and now, this is Miep's story.
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Theatre program.
THE STORY: The scene is Hazlehurst, Mississippi,
where the three Magrath sisters have gathered to await
news of the family patriarch, their grandfather, who is
living out his last hours in the local hospital. Lenny, the
oldest sister, is unmarried
Anne FrankThe Diary Of A Young Girl: The Definitive
Edition
Sensitively edited and with a connecting commentary by
editor, Mirjam Pressler, the abridged edition of The Diary
of a Young Girl by Anne Frank gives younger readers
their first introduction to the extraordinary diary of an
ordinary girl who has long become a household name.
This abridged edition has a short prologue written by the
editor, Mirjam Pressler, as well as a connecting
commentary. There are beautiful line drawings, family
photographs, and an Afterword to explain why the Diary
ends so abruptly. This shorter edition is ideal for younger
children who want to read Anne's diary for themselves
but are too young to appreciate the teenage issues that
Anne faces during her time in hiding.
The Diary of Anne Frank is a seminal piece of twentieth
century literature. It recounts the tragic and moving story
of a young Jewish teenager faced with the horrors of
Nazism. In it, Anne establishes a bond with her readers
that transcends both time and space, making them her
friends and confidants. Readers feel a connection with
each dream she had, each fear she endured, and each
struggle she confronted. Her diary ended, but her story
did not. The Lost Diary of Anne Frank picks up where her
original journal left off, taking the reader on a credible
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journey through the tragic final months of her life,
faithfully adhering to her own, very personal, diary format
in the process.In The Lost Diary of Anne Frank, Anne
receives mysterious help from many quarters. A strange
lady on the other side of the fence haunts her dreams.
Her sister falls in love with a Nazi guard. Her mom, once
vilified, becomes a hero. Anne struggles with the
existence of God and His presence or absence in all of
her ordeals. She contrasts the depravity of man with
what she sees as mankind's evident virtues. Her longing
to experience sensual pleasures is numbed by forced
over-exposure. She finds that in the Nazi efforts to
extinguish the humanity of their victims, a chorus of unity
evolves among the captives. Anne's vaulted dreams for
fame and notice are ultimately traded in for the true
longings of life, love, and peace. The Lost Diary of Anne
Frank follows her story to the chilling end.Dr. Johnny
Teague is an author and historian, having earned five
degrees, culminating with a doctorate in exposition from
Southwestern Baptist Theological Seminary. In
preparation for writing this book, he interviewed many
Holocaust survivors, and studied at the Holocaust
museums in Houston, Washington, D.C., and at Yad
Vashem in Israel. His studies have taken him to
numerous historical sites, including Auschwitz, Dachau,
the Corrie ten Boom House, and the Anne Frank House.
This is the true story of Syvia Perlmutter - a story of
courage, heartbreak, and finally survival despite the
terrible circumstances in which she grew up.
Abridged version of a Jewish girl's record of how her
family hid from Nazi occupiers in World War II Holland.
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A New York Times bestseller A USA Today bestseller
The long-hidden diary of a young Polish woman's life
during the Holocaust, translated for the first time into
English Renia Spiegel was born in 1924 to an upper-
middle class Jewish family living in southeastern Poland,
near what was at that time the border with Romania. At
the start of 1939 Renia began a diary. “I just want a
friend. I want somebody to talk to about my everyday
worries and joys. Somebody who would feel what I feel,
who would believe me, who would never reveal my
secrets. A human being can never be such a friend and
that’s why I have decided to look for a confidant in the
form of a diary.” And so begins an extraordinary
document of an adolescent girl’s hopes and dreams. By
the fall of 1939, Renia and her younger sister Elizabeth
(née Ariana) were staying with their grandparents in
Przemysl, a city in the south, just as the German and
Soviet armies invaded Poland. Cut off from their mother,
who was in Warsaw, Renia and her family were plunged
into war. Like Anne Frank, Renia’s diary became a
record of her daily life as the Nazis spread throughout
Europe. Renia writes of her mundane school life, her
daily drama with best friends, falling in love with her
boyfriend Zygmund, as well as the agony of missing her
mother, separated by bombs and invading armies. Renia
had aspirations to be a writer, and the diary is filled with
her poignant and thoughtful poetry. When she was
forced into the city’s ghetto with the other Jews,
Zygmund is able to smuggle her out to hide with his
parents, taking Renia out of the ghetto, but not,
ultimately to safety. The diary ends in July 1942,
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completed by Zygmund, after Renia is murdered by the
Gestapo. Renia's Diary has been translated from the
original Polish, and includes a preface, afterword, and
notes by her surviving sister, Elizabeth Bellak. An
extraordinary historical document, Renia Spiegel
survives through the beauty of her words and the efforts
of those who loved her and preserved her legacy.
On February 16,1944, Anne Frank recorded in her diary
that Peter, whom she at first disliked but eventually came
to love, had confided to her that if he got out alive, he
would reinvent himself entirely. This is the story of what
might have happened if the boy in hiding survived to
become a man. Peter arrives in America, the land of self-
creation; he flourishes in business, marries, and raises a
family. He thrives in the present, plans for the future, and
has no past. But when The Diary of a Young Girl is
published to worldwide acclaim and gives rise to bitter
infighting, he realises the cost of forgetting. Based on
extensive research of Peter van Pels and the strange
and disturbing life Anne Frank's diary took on after her
death, this is a novel about the memory of death, the
death of memory, and the inescapability of the past.
‘This is a brave novel in the strongest sense of the word,
carefully treading mined terrain to thought-provoking and
memorable effect’ Observer ‘In this thoughtful novel,
Feldman imagines how Peter's life might have turned out
had he survived the war. It's an account of his struggle to
deal with the past in the face of public obsession with the
girl he loved. Fascinating and moving’ New Woman ‘An
inventive postscript to the famous story’ Financial Times
On February 16,1944, Anne Frank recorded in her diary
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that Peter, whom she at first disliked but eventually came
to love, had confided in her that if he got out alive, he
would reinvent himself entirely. This is the story of what
might have happened if the boy in hiding survived to
become a man. Peter arrives in America, the land of self-
creation; he flourishes in business, marries, and raises a
family. He thrives in the present, plans for the future, and
has no past. But when The Diary of a Young Girl is
published to worldwide acclaim and gives rise to bitter
infighting, he realises the cost of forgetting. Based on
extensive research of Peter van Pels and the strange
and disturbing life Anne Frank's diary took on after her
death, this is a novel about the memory of death, the
death of memory, and the inescapability of the past.
Penguin Lost finds Viktor Zolotaryov sneaking back into
Kiev under an assumed identity to undertake a
dangerous mission: He wants to find Misha, his penguin,
whom he fears has fallen into the hands of the criminal
mob looking for Viktor himself. Guilt-ridden and
determined to do what it takes, Viktor falls in with a Mafia
boss who employs him in an election-rigging campaign,
in return for introducing Viktor to other mobsters who can
help him find Misha. And as Viktor goes from mobster to
mobster, trying to survive in Kiev’s criminal
underground, the evidence mounts that Misha may be
someplace even worse: the zoo of a Chechen warlord.
What ensues is for Viktor both a quest and an odyssey of
atonement, and for the reader, a stirring mix of the comic
and the tragic, the heartbreaking and the inspiring.
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